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Appendix I

a a OFFICE OF THE MAYOR

tacit TOWN OF WAr T NGFORD

CONNiwcTIOUT

WILLIAM W. DICKINSON, JR.

MAYOR December 12, 1996

Wallingford Town Council
46 South Main Street
Wallingford, CT 06492

Att: Robert F. Parisi, Council Chairman

Dear Council Members,

The Town recently received bids for the operation of the Resident Disposal'Program and the
Recycling Center. A copy of the bid tabulation is attached. Under Part A of the bid, the
Resident Disposal Program, the bid is being awarded to the low bidder, Wallingford Resident
Disposal, Inc:

Linder Part B, the operation of the Recycling Center, the two lower bids did not conform to the
bid specifications. Also, all bidders proposed a significant increase in cost to the Town, ranging
from sixty- eight percent to ninety- seven percent above the current cost.

The Ad Hoc Committee recommended that the Town reject all bids for the operation of the
Recycling Center. The Committee also recommended that the Town attempt to negotiate with
the current Recycling Center Operator, Stratford Baling Company, to extend its current
contract. This would provide time to revise the bid specifications and re-bid the service.

I am, therefore, seeking Town Council authorization to waive the bid for the operation of the
Recycling Center and to negotiate with Stratford Baling Company to extend the term of its
current contract.  If negotiations are successful, the terms will be brought to the Council for
approval.

If you have questions about this matter, please call Don Roe or Phil Hamel at 294-2060..

Sincerely,

W

William W.'Dickinson, Jr.
Mayor

cc:       Mr. Donald Roe

Mr. Philip Hamel,
Mr. Henry McCully
Mr. Robert Pedersen
Ad Hoc Committee
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PUBLIC BID NUMBER 9699 RESOURCE STRATFORD TOBACCO WALLINGFORD WALLINGFORD

RECOVERY BAILING VALLEY RESIDENT ItECYC me

RESIDENT DISPOSAL PROGRAM OPERATORSYSTEMS, MC.  CORP.  SANITATION DISPOSAL. INC.       COMPANY

AND RECYCLING CENTER OPERATOR SERVICE

Office of Program Plannl COMPANY

810 OPENING CeMerbrook. CT Shallad. CT ftdh WNrdsor. CT Wegnglbrd CT WsMrglbrd. CT

NOVEMBER 22, 1898, 2: EM PLY v

PART A

Household Refine 3111974tMY 1. 80 No am 130:       1. 45 No Old

Cost par Bag 7111974140199 1. 80 NO BM 1. 55 1. 49 No BM

711 1984130/ 99 1. 90 Hoe"      1. 80 1. 80 No Bk1

T/ 1M!- 9180/ 00 1 No am 1. 70 1. 83 No Bid

7n100- 6130101 1 No BM 1. 70 1. 60 No Bld

7HMI- 2128102 t No Bid 1. 78 1. 83 No Bid

He s 311197. 8130197 11: 00 No BM 7. 35 7. 00 No ale

Or'       unds 71119748/ 30198 11. 00 No Bid 7.55 7. 00 No BM

Cc 1111 7/ 1/ 984130/ 93 11. 90 No Old 7. 73 7. 23 No ON

711199- e130 00 1 NOB"      8. 00 1.25 No Bid

711100 8130101 1 Ne Bid 6.00 7. 25 No OM

711101 212= 2 1 NOW 8. 00 7. 50 NOW

Light thms 3111988138197 2. 25 No 13M 1. 75 1. 70  >    No Bkl

38 Pounds or Less 711197. 8130/ 98 2.25 No BM 1. 80 1. 70 No Bid

Cost per Item 7111994030/ 98 2. 35 No BM 1. 85 1. 80 No Bid

711199. 6/3o"      1 No OM 1. 90 1. 80 No Bid
711100- 130101 t flo BM 2.00 1. 90'      No Bid

711101 1126102 1 No am 2.25 1. 90 No 13M  '

Yard Waste 311197. 8130197 118. 00 No BM 98. 00 95. 00 No BM

Not In Plastic Bags 711197- CPJ 98:    118. 00 NO Bid 100.00 95.00 No Bid
Cost per Ten 711188- 6180t"    124. 00 NO BM 102. 00 97. 00 No am

711199- 4 30M0 1 No Bid 105.00'      97.00 No Bid
711100E 30MI 1 No BW 105.00 96.00 No Old

711M11128M12 1 No am 05.00 98. 00 No Bid

PART B

Hauler prOp4) R.     Year 1 No BM 50. 00 No BM NO Bm 53. 00
wlComtngled Metmlal You 2 No BM 1 Ho BM No Bid'     55.00
In Ple sde Bags Year 3 NORM t No am No Ski t

Cost per Ton Year 4 No HM 1 No® k1 No BM 1
Year 8 Noe" 1 No BM No Bid'       

Hauler Drop- Off Year 1 No BM 45.00 No Bid No Bld 58. 00
w/Com ngled Matattai Year 2 No BM 1 No BM No Bld 55. 00
0egvered Loose'     Year 3 No BM 1 No am NO Bid
Cost par Ton Year 4 No BM 1 No Bid No Bld'       1

YOU 5 No om 1 No Bid No Bid '      1

aesl p Olt Year 1 11. 900. 00 10, 400. 00 No BM No Bld 12. 200. 00

ost r......,ith'     Year 2 12. 400. 00 1 No Bkl No BM 12,200.00
Year 3 11, 900.00 1 NO Bkl No Old 1'
Year 4 1 No BM NO am 1

Yew 6 1 No BM No Bld r t

Ola! PAM

elms'       

Kcepliww. See Proposal See proposal Sue Proposal-  None

I- increase horn pmvla>s your by CPI
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J Wasie Systeme

ravening Funk Induslrbs
cCuuley Erdwpdm
M Sawkes Inc.

in" aly Ser* es,Corp.
xwpe Trucking
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